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Travel Bug, The (Series 3)

13 x 60'

EPISODIC BREAKDOWN

1. Scotland

No trip to Scotland is complete without hearing some bagpipes, putting on a kilt and playing golf.
From roaming the streets of Glasgow and mixing our own bottle of Scotch, to visiting the
birthplace of golf and strolling in the shadows of the magnificent Edinburgh Castle, this episode is
a journey that the history buffs will love!

2. Germany, Part I (Berlin and East Germany)

It’s one of Europe’s biggest countries and a nation full of history and culture. Starting the
adventure in the capital, Berlin, we head south to see where Berliners like to spend their holidays.
From there we check out the industrial side of the country, ending the first half of our trip on the
world’s biggest movable machine.

3. Germany, Part II (Wolfsburg, the Rhine)

Having explored the streets of Berlin and the nearby countryside, it’s time to hit the road west and
make his way across the country. The first stop is Wolfsburg, a city built around the incredible
Volkswagen factory. From there, it’s off to Cologne before following the compass south along the
beautiful River Rhine.

4. Kimberley Coast Adventure

We hop on board a luxury expedition cruise ship and heading into the wild and rugged Kimberley
Coast of Western Australia. We explore everything from the ancient aboriginal rock art, to unique
wildlife and wonders of Mother Nature. This expedition takes in all the highlights of the Kimberley
and it’s all done in 5-star comfort!

5. Northern Ireland, Part I (Belfast and the North Coast)

This time, we start the journey in the green pastures of Northern Ireland. It may only be a small
nation, but within its borders there’s a whole lot to see. It’s a dramatic country in more ways than
one. It all starts in the big smoke of Belfast, before heading to Downpatrick to learn about St Pat,
before moving north on the Causeway Coastal Route.
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6. Northern Ireland, Part II (Giants Causeway and the South)

This episode starts at the most visited site in Northern Ireland, The Giant’s Causeway. It’s a
dramatic coastal landmark that draws visitors from around the world. Then it’s off to the historic
city of Londonderry, on the banks of the Foyle River. From there we head underground at the
Subterranean National Park, before putting on an apron for a lesson in Irish cooking.

7. Northern Queensland

The tropical north of Australia is a favourite for Aussies looking for a holiday where you can walk
on secluded beaches, snorkel in warm, clear waters, relax in a resort or get stuck into a bit of
adrenalin pumping adventure. From The Great Barrier Reef and rainforest of the Daintree, to Port
Douglas and Cape Tribulation, this episode is one for the adventurous travellers!

8. Japan, Part I (Sendai, Fukushima)

It all starts with a train ride from Tokyo, taking him north into the mountainous interior. From there
we head to the ski resorts of Zao and Appi, before heading south, finishing the first leg of the trip
in the tsunami-devastated region of Sendai.

9. Japan, Part II (Okinawa)

This episode sees us hop on a flight south, to the warm and sunny island paradise of Okinawa.
It’s a part of Japan that a lot of western tourists don’t often visit. Despite only being a few hours
flight from Tokyo, the islands of Okinawa seem like they’re a world away – It’s a hidden gem
you’re sure to fall in love with!

10. Dubai

The United Arab Emirates is a place where ancient tradition crashes headlong into the modern
world. At its heart is Dubai, an urban giant, with the Arabian Desert on one side and the Persian
Gulf on the other. It’s a city of excess, with the world’s biggest building, the world’s biggest mall
and numerous other manmade wonders that will blow your mind.

11. England, Part I (London)

In this episode of The Travel Bug, we head to the heart of the United Kingdom! And where better
to start our journey than in one of the world’s great cities, London. We take in all the clichéd sites
and iconic locales, and most importantly, dig a little deeper to find some new experiences that tell
the story of this amazing city.

12. England, Part II (Northern England)

This episode sees us leaving the crowded streets and hitting the road in search of a little bit of
England’s history and to explore the rural parts of the country. Starting in Manchester, we visit the
home of the world’s most popular football team and learn a little about the industrial revolution.
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13. Special

This season’s finale takes us back to some of the highlights of the series, as well as a couple of
amazing places that we couldn't fit in. This includes a visit to the beautiful city of Frankfurt, and
fishing for barramundi on a crocodile infested billabong in The Northern Territory. It’s a fun and
adventurous episode that will leave you clamouring for more!


